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Chapter 102 (June 22,1982) An Act to amend certain Acts 
that provide for the retention of records. 

Chapter 103 (June 22, 1982) Appropriation Act No. 2, 
1982-83 grants to Her Majesty certain sums of money for 
the Government of Canada for the financial year ending the 
3Ist March, 1983. 

Chapter 104 (June 29, 1982) An Act to amend the statute 
law relating to certain taxes. 

Chapter 105 (June 29, 1982) An Act to amend the 
Petro-Canada Act. 

Chapter 106 (June 29, 1982) An Act to amend the 
Department of Energy, Mines and Resources Act. 

Chapter 107 (June 29,1982) An Act respecting petroleum 
incentives and Canadian ownership and control determina­
tion and to amend the Foreign Investment Review Act. 

Chapter 108 (July 7, 1982) An Act to establish the 
Cooperative Energy Corporation and the Cooperative 
Energy Development Corporation. 

Chapter 109 (July 7, 1982) An Act to establish a national 
program for occupational training. 

Chapter 1 10 (July 7, 1982) An Act respecting young 
offenders and to repeal the Juvenile Delinquents Act. 

Chapter 111 (July 7, 1982) An Act to enact the Access to 
Information Act and the Privacy Act, to amend the Federal 
Court Act and the Canada Evidence Act, and to amend 
certain other Acts in consequence thereof 

Chapter 112 (July 7, 1982) An Act respecting energy 
monitoring and to amend the Energy Supplies Emergency 
Act, 1979 and the Oil Substitution and Conservation Act. 

Chapter 113 (July 7, 1982) An Act respecting motor 
vehicle fuel consumption standards. 

Chapter 114 (July 7, 1982) An Act to amend the 
Petroleum Administration Act and to enact provisions 
related thereto. 

Chapter 115 (July 7, 1982) An Act to amend the Canada 
Business Corporations Act. 

Chapter 116 (July 7, 1982) An Act to amend the National 
Energy Board Act (No. 3). 

Chapter 1 17 (August 4, 1982) An Act to amend the 
Railway Act. 

Chapter 118 (August 4, 1982) An Act to amend the Small 
Businesses Loans Act (No. 3). 

Chapter 119 (August 4, 1982) An Act to provide for 
payments to persons in respect of dwellings insulated with 
urea formaldehyde foam insulation. 

Chapter 120 (August 4, 1982) An Act to provide 
supplementary borrowing authority. 

Chapter 121 (August 4, 1982) An Act to amend the 
National Harbours Board Act, the Government Harbours 
and Piers Act, the Harbour Commissions Act, the Canada 
Shipping Act and the Fishing and Recreational Harbours 
Act. 

Chapter 122 (August 4, 1982) An Act respecting 
compensation in the public sector of Canada. 

Chapter 1 23 (August 4, 1982) An Act to amend the 
Financial Administration Act (No. 2). 

Chapter 124 (October 27, 1982) An Act to amend the 
Holidays Act. 

Chapter 125 (October 27, 1982) An Act to amend the 
Criminal Code in relation to sexual offences and other 
offences against the person and to amend certain other Acts 
in relation thereto or in consequence thereof. 

Chapter 126 (November 4,1982) An Act to provide for the 
resumption and continuation of longshoring and related 
operations at ports on the west coast of Canada. 

Chapter 127 (November 8, 1982) An Act to provide 
supplementary borrowing authority (No. 2). 

Chapter 128 (December 16, 1982) An Act to amend the 
Bretton Woods Agreements Act and the International 
Development Association Act. 

Chapter 129 (December 16, 1982) An Act to amend the 
Customs Tariff and to repeal certain Acts in consequence 
thereof. 

Chapter 130 (December 16, 1982) An Act to amend the 
National Housing Act (No. 2). 

Chapter 131 (December 16, 1982) An Act respecting 
rebates of interest on farm loans made under the Farm 
Credit Act. 

Chapter 132 (December 16, 1982) Appropriation Act No. 
3,1982-83 grants to Her Majesty certain sums of money for 
the Government of Canada for the financial year ending the 
31st March, 1983. 

Chapter 133 (January 31, 1983) An Act to amend the 
Canada Agricultural Products Standards Act. 

Chapter 134 (January 31, 1983) An Act to change the 
name of the electoral district of Missisquoi to Brome-
Missisquoi. 

Chapter 135 (January 31, 1983) An Act to change the 
name of the electoral district of Saint-Michel to Saint-
Michel-Ahuntsic. 

Chapter 136 (January 31, 1983) An Act to amend the 
Supplementary Retirement Benefits Act (No. 2). 

Chapter 137 (February 15, 1983) An Act to change the 
name of the electoral district of Dauphin to Dauphin-Swan 
River. 

Chapter 138 (February 15,1983) An Act to amend the Old 
Age Security Act (No. 2). 

Chapter 139 (February 17, 1983) An Act to amend the 
Family Allowances Act, 1973. 

Chapter 140(March30,1983) An Act to amend the statute 
law relating to income tax (No. 2). 

Chapter 141 (March 30,1983) An Act to amend the Small 
Businesses Loans Act (No. 4). 


